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A long journey 

geschrieben von 
 Armin Oberscheider 

Jim was on his way home. At 
home he looked for his mum. But 
she wasn't there. Suddenly he 
heard a strange noise in the 
garden. He saw a UFO with his 
mum inside. He ran in the UFO 
and took off. Jim saw some funny 
aliens from another planet. Jim 
was nervous because the alien 
king came to him and asked him 
clever questions about the planet 
earth. Jim asked the alien king, 
"Are you from Mars, Saturn or 
Sun?" He answered, "We are from 
the planet sun." Jim looked out of 
the window and saw the huge sky 
at once a star exploded! Then 
alien Peter came with Jim's mum. 
He said, "I must take you home 
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with my fantastic spaceship. Some 
years later they landed in their 
garden and Jim couldn't remember 
anything.  
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